AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1131H CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 24 1 8

To amend title 11 and title 29, United States Code, to increase the amount
of unsecured claims for salaries and wages given priority in bankruptey,
to provide for payments to retirees to compensate for lost health insur-
ance benefits resulting from the bankruptey of their former employer,
to protect the health benefits of employees and retirees, and for other
purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JUNE 3, 2014

Mr. ROCKEFELLER (for himself and Ms. WARREN) introduced the following
bill; which was read twice and referred to the Committee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To amend title 11 and title 29, United States Code, to
increase the amount of unsecured claims for salaries
and wages given priority in bankruptey, to provide for
payments to retirees to compensate for lost health insur-
ance benefits resulting from the bankruptey of their
former employer, to protect the health benefits of em-

ployees and retirees, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,



AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

(a) SHORT TrrLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“Bankruptey Fairness and Employee Benefits Protection
Act of 20147,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

this Act 1s as follows:
Sec. 1. Short title.

TITLE I—FAIRNESS FOR EMPLOYEES AND RETIREES IN
CORPORATE BANKRUPTCIES

See. 101. Prohibition of unfair reductions to employee and retiree benefits.
Sec. 102. Payment of insurance benefits to retirees.

See. 103. Fair treatment of compensation.

See. 104. Venue; change of venue.

Sec. 105. Protection of benefits in chapter 9 bankruptey.

Sec. 106. Requirement to make pension contributions.

TITLE I—PROTECTION OF EMPLOYEE AND RETIREE HEALTI
BENEFITS

See. 201. Notification of extent to which health benefits can be modified or ter-
minated.

Sece. 202. Protection of retirees under certain collectively bargained agreements.

See. 203. Comptroller General report.

TITLE I—FAIRNESS FOR EM-
PLOYEES AND RETIREES IN
CORPORATE BANKRUPTCIES

SEC. 101. PROHIBITION OF UNFAIR REDUCTIONS TO EM-
PLOYEE AND RETIREE BENEFITS.

Sec-

(a) COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENTS.

tion 1113 of title 11, United States Code, is amended
(1) in subsection (b)—

(A) in paragraph (1)(A), by striking ‘“‘nec-

essary modifications in the employees benefits

and protections that are necessary to permit the

oS 2418 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

3
reorganization of the debtor’” and insert “‘min-
imum modifications in the employees benefits
and protections that are necessary to prevent
the liquidation of the debtor”; and
(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(3)(A) If the proposal made under paragraph
(1) provides for a modification of the health insur-
ance benefits of employees of the debtor, the pro-
posal shall provide for a modification of the health
insurance benefits of officers and directors of the
debtor—

“(1) to, at a minimum, be comparable to
the modification of health insurance benefits of
employees of the debtor; and

“(i1) such that the health insurance bene-
fits of officers and directors are not more gen-
erous than those of employees of the debtor.
“(B) If the proposal made under paragraph (1)

provides for a modification of any benefit of employ-
ees of the debtor other than health insurance bene-
fits, including wages and pension benefits, the pro-
posal shall provide for a modification of such benefit
of officers and directors of the debtor that is, at a

minimum, in an amount equal to the percentage by

oS 2418 IS



[E—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

4

which such benefit of employees of the debtor was
modified.”;

(2) in subsection (¢)

(A) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘“‘sub-

section (b)(1)” and inserting ‘“‘paragraphs (1)

and (3) of subsection (b)”’;

(B) by redesignating paragraphs (2) and

(3) as paragraphs (3) and (4), respectively; and

(C) by inserting after paragraph (1) the
following:

“(2) the debtor established by clear and con-
vineing evidence that any modification of the bene-
fits and protections of an employee of the debtor
proposed under subsection (b)(1) is the minimum
modification necessary to prevent the liquidation of
the debtor;”’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) The rejection of a collective bargaining agree-
ment under this section constitutes a breach of the agree-
ment, and shall entitle employees of the debtor to a claim

for damages.”.

(b) HEALTH INSURANCE BENEFITS OF RETIRED
EMPLOYEES.—Section 1114 of title 11, United States
Code, is amended—

(1) i subsection (f)—

oS 2418 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O T \© R (O R S i e e e e e e e T
N = O 00N N R WD = O

5}

(A) in paragraph (1)(A), by striking ‘“nec-
essary modifications in the retiree benefits that
are necessary to permit the reorganization of
the debtor” and insert ‘“‘minimum modifications
in the retiree benefits that are necessary to pre-
vent the liquidation of the debtor’’; and

(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(3) If the proposal made under paragraph (1) pro-
vides for a modification of the health insurance benefits
of retired employees of the debtor, the proposal shall pro-

vide for a modification of the health insurance benefits of

officers and directors of the debtor
“(A) to, at a minimum, be comparable to the
modification of health insurance benefits of retired
employees of the debtor; and
“(B) such that the health insurance benefits of
officers and directors are not more generous than
those of retired employees of the debtor.”; and
(2) in subsection (2)(3), by striking ‘“‘necessary
to permit the reorganization of the debtor” and in-
sert “the minimum modification necessary to pre-

vent the liquidation of the debtor”.

oS 2418 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TR N© I NS RN NG I NG I NS B NS R e e e T e e e T e
AN N R~ WD = O 0O 00NN B WND—= O

6
SEC. 102. PAYMENT OF INSURANCE BENEFITS TO RETIR-

EES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1114(j) of title 11, United
States Code, is amended to read as follows:

“(J)(1) No claim for retiree benefits shall be limited
by section 502(b)(7).

“(2)(A) A retired employee whose retiree benefits are
modified under subsection (e)(1) or (g) shall have a claim
in an amount equal to the value of the retiree benefits
lost as a result of the modification, which shall be reduced
by the amount paid by a debtor under subparagraph (B).

“(B)(1) In accordance with section 1129(a)(13)(B),
a debtor shall pay a retired employee with a claim under
subparagraph (A)—

“(I) cash in an amount equal to the 2-year cost
of premiums for continuation coverage (as defined in
section 602 of the Employee Retirement Income Se-
curity Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C. 1162)) for the retired
employee under section 602(3) of the Employee Re-
tirement Income Security Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C.
1162(3)); or

“(IT) if the retired employee is not eligible for
continuation coverage, cash in an amount equal to
the 2-year cost of premiums for a comparable health
insurance plan offered through a State Exchange,
Federally Facilitated Exchange, or Federal-State

oS 2418 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = =N Re - BN B o) W ) TR “S O T NO S e

7

Partnership Exchange established under the Patient
Protection and Affordable Care Act (42 U.S.C.
18001 et seq.).

“(11) Notwithstanding clause (i), if the court deter-
mines it to be in the interest of fairness and equity, the
court may require a debtor to pay a retired employee with
a claim under subparagraph (A) cash in an amount equal
to the cost of premiums for continuation coverage under
clause (1)(I) or for a comparable health insurance plan
under clause (1)(II) for a period of more than 2 years.

“(i11) The amount paid by a debtor under this sub-
paragraph shall not exceed the amount of the claim under
subparagraph (A).

“(C) Any amount of the claim under subparagraph
(A) that is not paid under subparagraph (B) shall be a
general unsecured claim.”.

(b) CONFIRMATION OF PLAN.—Section 1129(a)(13)
of title 11, United States Code, is amended to read as
follows:

“(13) The plan provides—

“(A) for the continuation, after the effec-
tive date of the plan, of the payment of all re-
tiree benefits (as defined in section 1114(a)), at
the level established pursuant to subsection

(e)(1) or (2) of section 1114, at any time before

oS 2418 IS



22
23
24
25

8
the confirmation of the plan, for the duration of
the period the debtor has obligated itself to pro-
vide such benefits; and
“(B) that the holder of a claim under sec-
tion 1114(3)(2)(A) shall receive from the debt-
or, on the effective date of the plan, cash equal
to the amount calculated under section
1114(5)(2)(B).”.
SEC. 103. FAIR TREATMENT OF COMPENSATION.
(a) PROHIBITION OF BONUS PAYMENTS.—Section
503(e) of title 11, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in paragraph (2)(B), by striking “or”” at the
end;
(2) by redesignating paragraph (3) as para-
oraph (4); and
(3) by inserting after paragraph (2) the fol-
lowing:
“(3) a bonus payment to an insider of the debt-
or, including an incentive-based bonus payment; or”.

(b) INCREASED PRIORITY CLAIM AMOUNT FOR EM-

PLOYEE WAGES AND BENEFITS.—Section 507(a) of title
11, United States Code, is amended—
(1) in paragraph (4)—
(A) by striking “$10,000” and inserting

“$25.0007; and

oS 2418 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

[\ I O T O T N0 R S e e e e e T e T e T
W N = O O 0N N R WD = O

9
(B) by striking “180 days” and inserting
“1 year”’; and

(2) in paragraph (5)

(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking “180
days” and inserting “1 year’’; and

(B) in subparagraph (B)(i), by striking
“$10,000” and inserting “$25,000”.

(¢) RECOVERY OF EXCESS COMPENSATION.—Section
547 of title 11, United States Code, is amended by adding
at the end the following:

“(J) The court, upon motion of a party in interest,
may prohibit a transfer of compensation made to an in-
sider of the debtor within 1 year before the date on which
the petition is filed if the court finds, after notice and
hearing, that the transfer—

“(1) was not made in the ordinary course of
business; or
“(2) resulted in unjust enrichment.”.
SEC. 104. VENUE; CHANGE OF VENUE.

Chapter 87 of title 28, United States Code, is amend-
ed—

(1) by amending section 1408 to read as fol-

lows:

oS 2418 IS



O o0 9 N U B WD

e T S e N e e T e
O o0 N O »n B~ WD = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

10
“§1408. Venue of cases under title 11

“Except as provided in section 1410, a case under
title 11 shall be commenced in the district court for the
district in which the largest share of employees, retired
employees, physical assets, and operations of the person
or entity that is the subject of the case were located in
the year immediately preceding the commencement of the
case.”’; and

(2) in section 1412, by striking “to a district
court for another district” and inserting “to the dis-
trict court for the district in which the principal
place of business in the United States of the person
or entity that is the subject of the case was located
in the year immediately preceding the commence-
ment of the case”.

SEC. 105. PROTECTION OF BENEFITS IN CHAPTER 9 BANK-
RUPTCY.

Section 901(a) of title 11, United States Code, is
amended—

(1) by inserting “507(a)(4), 507(a)(5),” after

“507(a)(2)7;

(2) by inserting “1113, 1114,” after

\}

“1111(b)”; and
(3) by inserting  “1129(a)(13),”  after
“1129(a)(10)".

oS 2418 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ T O R S i e e e e e e e T
—_— O O o0 N o unm R~ WD = O

22

TRIBUTIONS.

11

SEC. 106. REQUIREMENT TO MAKE PENSION CONTRIBU-

TIONS.
(a) REQUIREMENT To0 PAy MiNIMUM FUNDING CON-

Subchapter 1 of chapter 11 of title 11,

United States Code, is amended by adding at the end the
following:

“§1117. Duty of debtor in possession to make re-

quired pension contributions
“(a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section—

“(1) the term ‘pension plan’ has the meaning
eiven that term under section 3 of the Employee Re-
tirement Income Security Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C.
1002); and

“(2) the term ‘required pension contributions’
means contributions necessary to satisfy the min-
imum funding standards under sections 412 and
430 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 and sec-
tions 302 and 303 of the Employee Retirement In-
come Security Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C. 1082 and
1083), including any required installment contribu-
tions.

“(b) REQUIREMENT.—A debtor in possession that

23 sponsors a pension plan or is a member of the controlled

24 oroup with respect to such a plan, or the trustee of the

25 debtor in possession, shall—

oS 2418 IS



[E—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

21 PENSION CONTRIBUTIONS.

12

“(1) make all required pension contributions to
the pension plan that become due after the filing of
the petition; and

“(2) make such contributions on or before the
due dates specified in section 430()) of the Internal
Revenue Code and section 303(j) of the Employee
Retirement Income Security Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C.
1083(3)).".

(b) TREATMENT AS ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—

Section 503(b) of title 11, United States Code, is amend-

(1) in paragraph (8)(B), by striking “‘and” at
the end;

(2) in paragraph (9), by striking the period at
the end and inserting ““; and”’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(10) any required pension contributions under
section 1117 due to be made after the filing of the
petition that are unpaid.”.

(¢) PERFECTION OF STATUTORY LIENS FOR MISSED

Section 362(b) of title 11,

22 United States Code, is amended—

23
24

(1) in paragraph (27), by striking “and” at the

end;

oS 2418 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG I N TR NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= O O NN NN R, WD = O

13

(2) in paragraph (28), by striking the period at
the end and inserting ““; and”’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(29) under subsection (a), of any act to per-
fect, or to maintain or continue the perfection of, a
statutory lien imposed by section 430(k) of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 or section 303(k) of
the Employee Retirement Income Security Act (29
U.S.C. 1083(k)) (which shall not be voidable under
section 545 of this title), for failure to make con-
tribution payments required under those sections,
without regard to whether such contributions be-
came due or whether such lien arose before or after

the filing of the petition.”.

TITLE II—PROTECTION OF EM-
PLOYEE AND RETIREE
HEALTH BENEFITS

SEC. 201. NOTIFICATION OF EXTENT TO WHICH HEALTH
BENEFITS CAN BE MODIFIED OR TERMI-
NATED.

(a) INCLUSION IN SUMMARY PLAN DESCRIPTION.—
Section 102(b) of the Employee Retirement Income Secu-
rity Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C. 1022) is amended by inserting
“

; In the case of a group health plan (as so defined),

whether the provisions of the plan permit the plan sponsor

oS 2418 IS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
L R W NN = DO VO XN R WD~ O

14

or any employer participating in the plan to unilaterally
modify or terminate the benefits under the plan with re-
spect to employees, retired employees, and beneficiaries,
and when and to what extent benefits under the plan are
fully vested with respect to employees, retired employees,
and beneficiaries” after ‘“‘the name and address of such
issuer”’.

(b) PRESUMPTION THAT RETIRED EMPLOYEE
HeanTH BENEFITS CANNOT BE MODIFIED OR TERMI-
NATED.—Section 502 of the Employee Retirement Income
Security Act of 1974 (29 U.S.C. 1132) is amended by
adding at the end the following new subsection:

“(n) In the case of a suit brought under this title
by a participant or beneficiary relating to benefits of a
retired employee or the dependents of a retired employee
under a group health plan (as defined in section
733(a)(1)), the presumption for purposes of such suit
shall be that as of the date an employee retires or com-
pletes 20 years of service with the employer, benefits avail-
able under the plan during retirement of the employee are
fully vested and cannot be modified or terminated for the
life of the employee or, if longer, the life of the employee’s
spouse. This presumption can be overcome only upon a
showing, by clear and convincing evidence, that the terms

of the group health plan allow for a modification or termi-

oS 2418 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

| \O JEE O R O R O IR O R T S S S T e T e e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O wn kA WD = O

15

nation of benefits available under the plan and that the
employee, prior to becoming a participant in the plan, was
made aware, in clear and unambiguous terms, that the
plan allowed for such modification or termination of bene-
fits.”.

SEC. 202. PROTECTION OF RETIREES UNDER CERTAIN COL-

LECTIVELY BARGAINED AGREEMENTS.

Section 8 of the National Labor Relations Act (29
U.S.C. 158) is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(h) It shall be an unfair labor practice for any labor
organization and any employer to enter into any contract
or agreement, express or implied, whereby the organiza-
tion and employer agree to modify the terms of any pre-
vious agreement in a manner that would result in a reduc-
tion or termination of retiree health insurance benefits
provided to an employee or a dependent of an employee
under the previous agreement, if such modification of the
terms of the previous agreement occurs after the date on
which the employee retires.”.

SEC. 203. COMPTROLLER GENERAL REPORT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 180 days after the

date of enactment of this Act, the Comptroller General

of the United States shall submit to Congress a report

oS 2418 IS



16

I on the strategies that corporations use to avoid obligations

2 to pay promised employee and retiree benefits.

3
4

(b) CONTENTS.

The report under subsection (a)

shall include a discussion of—

(1) the use of spin-offs, mergers, subsidiaries,
bankruptcies, asset sales, and other strategies to
avoid obligations to pay promised employee and re-
tiree benefits;

(2) the impact of such avoidance on the finan-
cial, physical, and mental well-being of employees
and retirees;

(3) the impact on Federal and State budgets
when employers terminate or reduce the benefits of
employees and retirees, including the costs that are
incurred when employees and retirees seek assist-
ance from Federal and State government programs
and services as a result of the termination or reduc-
tion of their employment-related benefits; and

(4) recommendations to prevent corporations
from evading contractual obligations to pay em-

ployee and retiree benefits.

O

oS 2418 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2014-06-09T19:49:28-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




